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God of creation. We are so grateful for the life that we have in the human realm. Uh, we are so excited to be here in 
these glorious, um, energetic, uh, bodies and know that, uh, you can guide us beautifully into maintaining, uh, what we 
are working with right now, so that it, it might truly support us as we move back to God's sourced creation and even 
beyond that, to God's sourced existence. So we are, uh, seeking your sweetness, your guidance, your grace, your 
empowerment. We're, um, seeking you in all that we do, in every cell of our body, in every vibrational particle, in our 
quantum, uh, in all that we are how we are seeking to experience you. We love you. We glorify and adore your holy 
name in worship, and we see your splendor. It excites us. We experience the marvelous, uh, miraculous, incredible, uh, 
gift that you are to us. And we know that we only have this a tiny little glimmer of who you truly are. And we sing. 
Excuse me. We sing your praise and we are so, uh, so grateful to be in your presence, God. And now we, uh, feel the true 
brightness and we experience, uh, light unification with, uh, fortified with God's strength, light unification, true 
brightness, fortified with God strength 

And all that we are. And as the true brightness, light, unification fortified with God's strength is kicking into full gear, our 
vibratory divine essence of God. And that access is now moving through, uh, all that we are. And we are experiencing 
not only the vibratory divine essence of God, but we're experiencing God mind and really the absolute clarity of purity 
and truth, the clarity with God mind. Um, take some time here to just experience all of what we've already set up to 
brightness, light, unification, fortified with God's strength, the vibratory divine essence of God and God mind. And you 
might, as you allow your eyes to rest in a closed, uh, peaceful, relaxed way, begin to just feel vibratory shifts. Feel your, 
um, beingness, uh, strengthening your for being fortified. Uh, feel perhaps the synergy of the what, uh, ends up being 
vibrating particles and what ends up being this higher, uh, frequency, uh, of maybe spirit cell for energy. It's getting 
really bathed in this rich, glorious gold energy of God, God, mind light, unification true brightness, and feeling that even 
before there was individuation and individuality, feeling that feeling what it was like to just be 

Part of the whole part of the God self and begin to experience as well the protection of the energetic experience that, 
um, source from God existence, not even God sourced creation, but the source of who we were, uh, even before there 
was, uh, kind of a creation. We existed as God. We existed as one with God, as a piece of God, a part of God. And just 
feel that protection of that essence of God, of us and just protection throughout our life. And just slowly and gently, uh, 
you can begin. Side slide. You need to open your eyes and just experience doing some side slide as you flow into God, 
consciousness, truth, wisdom, and God, life authority, uh, especially in the light of cell mirroring, but that God, life 
authority. Just allow that to just flow into God. Consciousness, truth, wisdom and God life authority. Seeing this 
beautiful authority established and particles vibrating in the cellular structure or shutting down or off anything that 
would inhibit this experience. Staying with this very high frequency, this high vibration, so much light and brightness, so 
much power and strength, and then profound clarity. Beautiful. And staying in this God, consciousness and truth, 
wisdom, staying in this God life, authority, brilliance, brightness, light, unification, God's strength, the vibratory divine 
essence of God. And God mind running right through you, being permeating you and the protection, uh, re-energizing 
the protection from the God essence, uh, to your energetic experience. 

And as you are ready, uh, you can open your eyes and come back into a level of consciousness. 

 

 


